
In accordance with ADA regulations, anyone in need of an accommodation to participate in the meeting 
 should notify the ADA coordinator at 704-920-2100 at least forty-eight (48) hours prior to the meeting. 

 

CABARRUS COUNTY 
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

 
WORK SESSION  
AUGUST 7, 2017 

4:00 P.M. 
 

 

1.  CALL TO ORDER - CHAIRMAN 
 

2.  APPROVAL OF WORK SESSION AGENDA – CHAIRMAN 
 

3.  DISCUSSION ITEMS – NO ACTION   
 

3.1 Communications and Outreach - Branding Discussion   Pg. 3 
3.2 Stepping Up Program - Case Management Services Progress Update   Pg. 4 
 

4.  DISCUSSION ITEMS FOR ACTION AT AUGUST 21, 2017 MEETING  
  
4.1 CCS - Request to Reappropriate FY17 Capital Funding   Pg. 5 
4.2 Finance – Acceptance of Construction Bids for a New Performance Learning Center and High 

School for Cabarrus County Schools   Pg. 8 
4.3 Finance - Resolution Approving Installment Contract Financing for Various Public Projects Up 

to $128,105,000   Pg. 10 
4.4 KCS - Funding Request for Contingency to Cover a Change Order for the Kannapolis Middle 

School Construction Project   Pg. 19 
4.5 KCS - Request to Reappropriate FY17 Capital Funding   Pg. 27 
4.6 RCCC - Request to Reappropriate FY17 Capital Funding   Pg. 30 
4.7 Appointments – Concord Downtown Development Corporation (CDDC)   Pg. 34 
4.8 Active Living and Parks Department – Youth Athletic Discussion   Pg. 35 
4.9 County Manager - Reappropriation of Funds for Ongoing Projects, Grants and Commitments   

Pg. 36 
4.10 Finance - Approval of Project Ordinances and Budget Amendments Related to CIP Funded 

Projects in the FY18 General Fund Budget    Pg. 41 
4.11 Finance – Delegate JCPC Board of Commissioner Authority to Finance Director for Review 

and Signature of Sub-Recipient Program Agreements   Pg. 66 
4.12 Human Services - Energy Programs Outreach Plan   Pg. 68 
4.13 Infrastructure and Asset Management - Bid Award for Trucks, Vans and SUVs   Pg. 74 
4.14 Planning and Development Department -  Proposed Text Amendment to Chapter 7 

TEXT2017-00005   Pg. 77 
4.15 Planning and Development Department - Proposed Text Amendment to Chapter 4 

TEXT2017-00006 - Public Hearing 6:30 P.M.   Pg. 81 
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In accordance with ADA regulations, anyone in need of an accommodation to participate in the meeting 
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4.16 Tax Collector - New Tax Collection Services Contracts for Harrisburg, Kannapolis, Locust, 
Midland and Mt. Pleasant  Pg. 86 

 

5.  APPROVAL OF REGULAR MEETING AGENDA   Pg. 109 

 
6.  CLOSED SESSION 
 
6.1 Closed Session – Pending Litigation and Economic Development   Pg. 113 
 
7.  ADJOURN   
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Account Information
Department Project / Grant Org-Object-Proj         FY17 

GL Codes
FY18 GL Codes Account Description Amount Justification

Cabarrus County Schools Capital Outlay 00197210-9701 00197210-9701 Bed for Wrecker $95,000.00 These funds have been encumbered.  DPI would not go out for bids until they 
got 2 LEA's to committ. Now, they have those commitments and are going 
out for bid. Our PO is issued to DPI. DPI issues bid. 

Cabarrus County Schools Capital Outlay 00197210-9701 00197210-9701 Purchase of 10 school buses  $         880,000.00 These funds have been encumbered.  Estimated delivery date is July 31, 2017

Cabarrus County Schools Capital Outlay 00197210-9701 00197210-9701 20 mobile units  $      2,203,527.18 Mobile Unit delivery and setup in process. Per contract, payment will not be 
processed until until has been sucessfully set up.  Expected completion by 
late  August.   Furniture orders will be complete by late August (invoices in 
September).  Technology to follow set up of units.

TOTAL $3,178,527.18 

Attachment number 1 \n
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Account Information
Department Project / Grant Org-Object-Proj         FY17 

GL Codes
FY18 GL Codes Account Description Amount Justification

Kannapolis City Schools Capital Outlay 00197230-9702 00197230-9702 Capital Outlay $443,709.24 KCS received $441,739 for buses in March and are waiting for them to be 
completed.  The balance of $1,970.24 can be used for radios for the buses.

Kannapolis City Schools Capital Outlay-Facilities Maint 00197230-9702-FMD 00197230-9702-FMD Replace Non-Compliant 
Playground

$15,000.00 KCS would like to move the remaining funds to the Non-Compliant 
Playground project at Shady Brook Elementary

Kannapolis City Schools Capital Outlay-Facilities Maint 00197230-9702-FMD 00197230-9702-FMD Balance of Forest Park Chiller 
Replacement

$11,800.00 KCS would like to move the remaining funds to the Non-Compliant 
Playground project at Shady Brook Elementary

TOTAL  $         470,509.24 

S:\Finance\Common\AGENDA ITEMS\2017-18\2. August 2017\Re-appropriations\KCS Re-appropriation
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Account Information
Department Project / Grant Org-Object-Proj         FY17 

GL Codes
FY18 GL Codes Account Description Amount Justification

Rowan Cab Com College Capital Outlay 00197240-9719 00197240-9719 South Campus Student Center 
Renovations

$84,955.15 The majority of this project was completed, but the final renovations to the 
cafeteria portion of the student center were put on hold until additional 
funding to meet the estimated project budget could be identified.  Funds 
were allocated from the College's Bookstore fund balance in Spring 2017 
(the State allows the College to use Bookstore funds for capital projects 
related to a Student Center or Student Cafeteria).  The scope and 
requirements for this final stage of the sudent center renovations are being 
completed now, with estimated completion of the project by June 2018.  We 
request reappropriation of the remaining funds in this project to be used in 
conjunction with Bookstore fund balance to complete this project

Rowan Cab Com College Capital Outlay 00197240-9719 00197240-9719 South Campus Building Access 
Security Enchancement

                9,586.71 This project was a phased rollout across all of our campuses in both counties 
and the first phase of security enhancements at South Campus was 
completed.  Following completion of Phase I, we prototyped the external 
access solution at West Avenue to confirm the functionality met our needs, 
and then rolled the solution out for several buildings at North Campus.  We 
are currently bidding Phase II External Access Controls of the project for 
South Campus and request reappropriation of the balanced remaining in this 
project to be used along with Campus Access Fee monies to complete this 
project estimated to be $20 000 by end of September 2017

Rowan Cab Com College Capital Outlay 00197240-9719 00197240-9719 $100,000 FY 2017 Annual 
Appropriation Balance

 $           29,012.64 We request reappropriation of the funds remaining from FY2017 to be used 
in conjunction with capital funding for FY2018 for the CBTC air 
conditioning project.  This project is currently out for bid with estimated 
completion in approximately 90 days.

Rowan Cab Com College Capital Outlay 00197240-9719 00197240-9719 Allocation for Vehicle  $           30,000.00 In keeping with the College's emphasis on being good stewards and 
maximizing our sustainability efforts, we had planned to use this money to 
procure a Hybrid Van before the end of Fiscal 2017.  We attempted two state 
bids because a Hybrid van was not available for purchase on State Contract.  
Neither of the bids yielded any responses.  In May, we received information 
that a Hybrid van is now available through Chrysler, but it is not availbale on 
State Contract and at the time we received the information, the State 
Purchasing & Contracts Division had cut-off bids until Fiscal 2017 year end 
closeout was completed.  Since that time, our Purchasing Offier has been 
told that a Hybrid van is not yet available.  Therefore, since we need the van 
now and do not feel like we can wait longer for a Hybird solution, we request 
reappropriation of these funds to be used to procure a van from State contract 
and anticipate that the purchase can be completed within 60 days.

S:\Finance\Common\AGENDA ITEMS\2017-18\2. August 2017\Re-appropriations\RCCC Re-appropriation final
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Account Information
Department Project / Grant Org-Object-Proj         FY17 

GL Codes
FY18 GL Codes Account Description Amount Justification

Rowan Cab Com College Capital Outlay 00197240-9719 00197240-9719 Cosmetology Facility repairs  $         120,000.00 After completing initial engineering efforts to find a solution to the humidity 
problem at our current Cosmetology facility at West Avenue in Kannapolis, 
we put this project on hold because we were approached by the City of 
Kannapolis about moving our facility to make way for the new Intimidators 
Stadium in downtown Kannapolis.  We did not want to proceed and spend 
money on a facility that we believe we will be vacating next year, so we put 
this on hold until we have confirmation form the City about wheter or not we 
are moving.  Currently, the City is completing due diligence on a property 
that we would relocated to, but we do not have confirmation from them yet 
that the purchase will be completed and they will be able to fund the 
appropriate renovations of the new space in time for us to relocate in July 
2018.  If the move does not occur, we will have to correct the humidity 
problem, but if we move, there should not be a problem in the new facility.  
We request reappropriation of this funding to be used to correct the humidity 
problem at West Avenue if the Cosmetology relocation does not occur.

TOTAL  $         273,554.50 

S:\Finance\Common\AGENDA ITEMS\2017-18\2. August 2017\Re-appropriations\RCCC Re-appropriation final
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Cabarrus County Government

65 Church Street SE (28025) • P.O. Box 707 Concord, NC 28026-0707 
Phone: 704.920.2100 • Fax: 704.920.2820 

Website: www.cabarruscounty.us

August 21, 2017

David Locklear, Acting Chief
Economic and Family Services
2420 Mail Service Center
Raleigh, NC  27699-2420

Dear Mr. Locklear,

Please note that on August 21, 2017, the Cabarrus County Board of Commissioners 
reviewed and approved the FY18 Energy Programs Outreach Plan for Cabarrus County 
Department of Human Services.

The Board of Commissioners is in full support of these energy programs and their goal of 
providing assistance to families that find themselves in a heating or cooling related 
emergency.  

Sincerely,

Stephen M. Morris, Chair
Cabarrus County Board of Commissioners
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ATTACHMENT Exhibit A Exhibit B Exhibit C Exhibit D Exhibit E Exhibit F Aggregate Notes

VENDOR 10,000# GVWR    
4 WD Truck (1)

11,400# GVWR Truck, 
Cab/Chassis with service 

body and ladder rack, 
add ladder rack (1) 
(Knapheide quote)   

Mid-Size SUV 
with Police 
Package (1)

Full Size Van  
(1)

Small Sized 
Van (1)

Mid Size SUV 
4WD (1)

TOTAL

Cloninger Ford $45,610.00 $51,266.73 $30,510.00 $33,971.00 $32,637.00 $31,813.00 $225,807.73

Ben Mynatt $41,690.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $28,422.00 $70,112.00

Hilbish Ford $39,831.98 $44,618.73 $30,200.45 $27,280.40 $22,997.66 $30,648.50 $195,577.72

Department 
Requesting EMS IAM - BM Emer Mgmt ALP IT Commerce

Budgeted Amount $42,600.00 $53,600.00 $30,000.00 $31,600.00 $25,000.00 $34,100.00
Add in Equip $7,055.00  $8,500.00    

TOTAL $49,655.00 $53,600.00 $38,500.00 $31,600.00 $25,000.00 $34,100.00
Bid Opening       (date 

& time): 7/21/2017 1:36 PM
Location:
Present:  Michael Miller Tom Nunn Dennis Furr Connie White

Sealed Bids Received from:

VEHICLE BID TABULATION FY 2018

Conference Room B Governmental Center

Cloninger Ford - Hickory
Ben Mynatt
Hilbish
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For jurisdictions under the new Collection contract.

Annual Billing FY2016
Collection Division FY16 Budget $973,542
Minus cost of NCDMV Collections ($314,380)
Collection Division Budget to be Shared $659,162
Plus 10% Overhead
Total Cost of Collections to be Shared
50% Total Collection Cost to be Shared

FY2017 % of FY2017 FY 2017 - New Method with Concord

Cities Annual Total Bills Cost
Number of 

bills
Savings Per 

Muni
CI03  Mt. Pleasant 930              0.99% $3,589 930             2 1,860               1,729$          
CI04  Kannapolis 18,441        19.60% $71,058 18,441        2 36,882             34,176$        
CI05  Locust 328              0.35% $1,269 328             2 656                   613$             
CI01  Harrisburg 6,782          7.21% $26,139 6,782          2 13,564             12,575$        

Total City 26,481 28.31% $102,055
Concord (estimated) 40,000        2 80,000             

CI06  Midland approximately $10,000 2,407          2 4,814               5,186$          
(Not under this agreement, charged at 1.50%) $112,055 137,776           54,279$        

Overall County Gain 25,721$           

Cost at $2 per bill

Current Contracted Method without 
Concord New Contracted Method with Concord

Collection Cost Calculation - FY2017

94,083

$65,916
$725,078
$362,539
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CABARRUS COUNTY

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
REGULAR MEETING

        AUGUST 21, 2017
6:30 P.M.

MISSION STATEMENT

THROUGH VISIONARY LEADERSHIP AND GOOD STEWARDSHIP, WE WILL 
ADMINISTER STATE REQUIREMENTS, ENSURE PUBLIC SAFETY, DETERMINE 

COUNTY NEEDS, AND PROVIDE SERVICES THAT CONTINUALLY ENHANCE 
QUALITY OF LIFE

CALL TO ORDER BY THE CHAIRMAN

PRESENTATION OF COLORS

INVOCATION

A. APPROVAL OR CORRECTION OF MINUTES 
1. Approval or Correction of Meeting Minutes

B. APPROVAL OF THE AGENDA

C. RECOGNITIONS AND PRESENTATIONS
1. Planning and Development - Recognition of Outgoing Planning and 

Zoning Commission Members
2. Active Living and Parks – Recognition of Seth Green’s Eagle Scout 

Service Project at Rob Wallace Park

D. INFORMAL PUBLIC COMMENTS (Each speaker is limited to 3 minutes)

E. OLD BUSINESS

F. CONSENT AGENDA
(Items listed under Consent are generally of a routine nature. The Board may take 
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action to approve/disapprove all items in a single vote. Any item may bewithheld 
from a general action, to be discussed and voted upon separately at the 
discretion of the Board.)
1. CCS - Request to Reappropriate FY17 Capital Funding 
2. County Manager - Reappropriation of Funds for Ongoing Projects, Grants and 

Commitments 
3. County Manager - Wireless Communications Site Lease at Former 

Fairgrounds Property 
4. County Manager - Wireless Communications Lease at Kannapolis Middle 

School 
5. Finance - Approval of Project Ordinances and Budget Amendments Related 

to CIP Funded Projects in the FY18 General Fund Budget 
6. Finance – Delegate JCPC Board of Commissioner Authority to Finance 

Director for Review and Signature of Sub-Recipient Program Agreements
7. Human Services - Energy Programs Outreach Plan 
8. Infrastructure and Asset Management - Bid Award for Trucks, Vans and SUVs 
9. KCS - Funding Request for Contingency to Cover a Change Order for the 

Kannapolis Middle School Construction Project 
10. KCS - Request to Reappropriate FY17 Capital Funding
11. RCCC - Request to Reappropriate FY17 Capital Funding 
12. Sheriff's Office - Request to Award a Service Weapon to Sergeant Eric 

Sossoman Upon Retirement 
13. Tax Collector - New Tax Collection Services Contracts for Harrisburg, 

Kannapolis, Locust, Midland and Mt. Pleasant 
14. Tax Administration - Refund and Release Report - July 2017 

G. NEW BUSINESS
1. Economic Development Investment – Project Hercules II – Public Hearing 6:30 

P.M.
2. Planning and Development - Proposed Text Amendments to Chapter 7 

TEXT2017-00004 - Public Hearing 6:30 P.M. 
3. Planning and Development Department - Proposed Text Amendment to 

Chapter 7 TEXT2017-00005 - Public Hearing 6:30 P.M. 
4. Planning and Development Department - Proposed Text Amendment to 

Chapter 4 TEXT2017-00006 - Public Hearing 6:30 P.M. 
5. Active Living and Parks Department – Youth Athletic Discussion
6. Finance - Resolution Approving Installment Contract Financing for Various 

Public Projects Up to $128,105,000 

H. APPOINTMENTS TO BOARDS AND COMMITTEES
1. Appointments - Active Living and Parks Commission
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2. Appointments – Cardinal Innovations Healthcare Solutions Oversight 
Committee

3. Appointments – Mental Health Advisory Board
4. Appointments – Concord Downtown Development Corporation (CDDC)

I. REPORTS
1. County Manager - Monthly New Development Report 
2. County Manager - Monthly Reports on Building Activity 
3. EDC - July 2017 Monthly Summary Report 
4. Finance - Monthly Financial Update 
5. BOC - Receive Updates from Commission Members Who Serve as Liaisons to 

Municipalities or on Various Boards/Committees 
6. Request for Applications for County Boards/Committees 

J. GENERAL COMMENTS BY BOARD MEMBERS

K. WATER & SEWER DISTRICT OF CABARRUS COUNTY

L. CLOSED SESSION

M. ADJOURN

IN ACCORDANCE WITH ADA REGULATIONS, ANYONE WHO NEEDS AN
ACCOMMODATION TO PARTICIPATE IN THE MEETING SHOULD NOTIFY THE ADA
COORDINATOR AT 704-920-2100 AT LEAST FORTY-EIGHT (48) HOURS PRIOR TO

THE MEETING.

Scheduled Meetings:

September 5 Work Session 4:00 p.m. Multipurpose Room
September 18 Regular Meeting 6:30 p.m. BOC Meeting Room
October 2 Work Session 4:00 p.m. Multipurpose Room
October 16 Regular Meeting 6:30 p.m. BOC Meeting Room

Mission: Through visionary leadership and good stewardship, we will
administer state requirements, ensure public safety, determine county needs,and 
provide services that continually enhance quality of life.
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Vision: Our vision for Cabarrus is a county where our children learn, our
citizens participate, our dreams matter, our families and neighbors thrive, andour 
community prospers.

Channel 22 Broadcast Schedule
Cabarrus County Board of Commissioners' Meetings

The most recent Commissioners' meeting is broadcast at the following days and 
times. Agenda work sessions begin airing after the 1st Monday of themonth 
and are broadcast for two weeks up until the regular meeting. Then the regular 
meeting begins airing live the 3rd Monday of each month and is broadcast 
up until the next agenda work session.

Sunday - Saturday 1:00 P.M.
Sunday - Tuesday 6:30 P.M.
Thursday & Friday 6:30 P.M.
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